ABATEMENT APPROVAL REQUEST

Account Number: 010575 Map/Lot/Sequence: 15-10345 Bill #(s}): 199918
Owner Name: Retelle Denise
Owner Name:
Malling Address: 34 Marshview Cir
Seabrook, NH 03874
Parce! Location: 34 MARSHVIEW CIRCLE Total Abatement Amount: $48.39

Cause of Abatement: Homeowner discovered a pipe that had been leaking, after receiving a higher than usual bill. it
was determined it had been leaking sincs the fall and went into the ground, not into the sewer.

Curﬁs-gélayt%

Woater Superintendent

DATE:

THE ABOVE APPLICATION FOR AN ABATEMENT HAS BEEN MADE PER ORDER,

6/1/202

Date: 04/01/20

0

Theresa A Kyle, Chairperson

Elia M Brown, Vice Chairperson

Aboul B Khan, Clerk

Respectfully submitted,
Evie Wasson, Water Clerk
GL Account # ~ Reason(s) for Abatement Year Amount
20-000-11500-000 |ABATE WATER USE 2020
21-000-11 500-000 |ABATE SEWER USE 2020 48.39
. CHARGE 2020
21-000-11 500=004 j SEWER SERVICE CHARGE 2020
20-520-34020-001 |ABATE APPLICATION FEE FOR NEW SERVICE 2020
L YD) ABATE INSTAS 1 Sy CYVALTEE ol
TOTAL ABATEMENT AMOUNT $48.39

Original to: Tax Coliector CC to: Water Office and Finance Office




Evie Wasson

From: denise retelle [denise_retelle@yahoo.com]
Sent: Monday, June 01, 2020 1:41 PM

To: Evie Wasson

Subject: Re: Abatement Request Form

Hello Evie,

It was an outside pipe that burst in the late fall {(end of November, beginning of December). It was the pipe for the lawn imrigation system and the
overflow was in my yard. You stated because nong of the water went through the sewage system that | should not be charge for that piece of the bill. 1
did discover the problem until late January (via a very large lce cube). The pipe has since been repaired by a licensed plumber.

Thank You
Denise

On Monday, June 1, 2020, 01:20:13 PM EDT, Evie Wasson <gwasson@seabrooknh.org> wrote:

Hi Denise,

Sorry for the delay, but | kind of knew when | read what you wrote on the abatement paperwork, it may not fly. |
know we spoke about what had actually happened, but it need to be noted on the request. As it furns out, |
don’t remember exactly what the leak was from, as | speak with numerous people throughout the week. Can
you elaborate a bit more? What exactly was leaking, how you discovered it, how it was repaired, etc? Was
there a plumber involved in the repair, do you have an invoice for the repair?

Evie Wasson

Backflow Inspector
Secretary/Clerk

Town of Seabrook
Water Department

550 Route 107
Seabrook, NH 03874
Phone: (603) 474-9921
Fax: (603) 474-3399

water@seabrooknh.org

website: www.seabrocknh.info




TOWN OF SEABROOK, NH SELECTMENS' OFFICE
P O BOX 456 SEABROOK NH 03874
LAND OWNERS WATER ABATEMENT/REFUND REQUEST FORM

Regquest: Abatement / Refund X  Complaint Report Date:

Land Owner Name Denise Retelle

Mailing Address 34 Marshview Circle, Seabrook, NH 03874 Telephone # (978) 204-0044
Street Address: 34 MARSHVIEW CIRCLE Abatement/Refund Amount  $48.39

Per my discussion with Evie T had a pipe that broke late fall but was unaware of it until January. There was no

sewage being used as it was leaking outside onto my lawn.

Additional information (please include copies of any documentation of repairs performed, such as bill, invoice, etc):

Land Owner Name: (Print) X Denise Retelle

5 Vol F
Land Qwner Signature: X 1 /2048 2 9 ://’,,

* Excerpt from page 24 of Seabrook Municipal Water System Ordinance

Section 9.11 Abatement
Abatements may be made by the Water Commissioners upon the customer’s request, provided one of the

following reasons is given:

» financial hardship, as evidenced by the customer receiving aid at the time of the abatement;

« fire or disaster;
s to correct a billing error; or
« for such other reason as may be determined by the Board of Water Commissioners.

Customers shall not be prohibited from making an abatement request, nor shall the Water Commissioners
be obligated to grant an abatement.

Action Taken:

Date:




34 MARSHVIEW CIR - Account # 010575

Retelle Denise MLS: 15-103-45
Date Mo. | Gallons | ~ CostperQuarter | Bill
Read | of: | Tevious c""e"t, Used | Water  Sewer WSC SSC Total | # | Billed Paid

0200420, Jan 588,542 611,850 23,308
03/03/20 Feb 611,850, 613,593 1,743 |

03/31/20 Mar 613,503 615,462 1,869
2020 - 1st Quarter Usage' 26,920 92.75' 50.94 15.3015.30 174.28|199918| 04/30/20 NYP

Billed

%|01/31/19 Jan 1,107,391 1,109,763 2,362

‘203101/19 Feb , 555568 566,056’ 488

=|04/03/19  Mar | 556,056 557,603 1,547

8= 7 2016 ~Tst Quarter Usage, 4,397 4.62  2.55 15.30|15.30  37.76|182091| 04/20/19 05/24/19
A Differences:| 22,523 Al 48.39| i

A

Estimate based on a prior years' normal usage

ter VENISE 3

anging a UBMETER Record (010575 1
wrel | Usage Hist] Gun  Readings |
PaodDeie [ Previeadng [ heReadng o oo
3/3172020 613593 81 5 452 | 1,869
3/03/2020 611,850 613593 | 1,743 26,920
2104/2020 588,642 611,850 | 23,308
1/03/2020 570610 586,542 12,932
12/05/2018 573,644 575,610 1.966
11/01/2013 £71.832 573,644 1.812
10/01/2019 569,927 571,832 1,806 l
9/04/2019 566,523 569,927 3,404
B8/01/2019 563,809 566,523 2714
Hol/e09 I 561,318 563,809 2,491
6/04/2013 559,238 561,318 2,080
5/02/2019 557,603 559,238 | 1,635
410372019 556,058 557,603 1,547 |
3/01/2019 555,566 556,066 ! 438 |
|
ing 2 UB Master Record (030575 - RETELLE DENISEM : , ‘
anging a UBMETER Record (010575 i)
eral |Usage Hist| Gun  Readings I
4,397
|
|
RecdDate | PrevReading | ThisReading | Usage —
 Higit LB Wl L
170242019 1.105,899 1.107.391 1,492
11[30,’2018 1 1[]4.434 1,105, 899 1415



